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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 
 

MD Helicopters Expands Flexible Financing Options for Customers 
New Service Addresses Key Customer Need 

 
 
Mesa, Ariz., April 13, 2021 – As part of the company’s renewed focus on strengthening customer 
support, MD Helicopters, Inc. (MDHI) will be working with National Bank of Arizona to provide 
qualified customers with expanded aircraft finance and lease options, subject to credit approval.  
The financing options offered through the new relationship with National Bank of Arizona allows 
MDHI to continue to improve and expand customer services and overall customer experience and 
satisfaction. 
 
“Today’s economic environment is affecting customers across the industry from utility operators 
to law enforcement, pushing them to find new financing avenues,” says Jason Lindauer, Director 
of Commercial Sales. “Our new leadership is committed to strengthening our customer support 
by directly addressing our customers’ needs. We’ve worked to create this relationship with 
National Bank of Arizona in direct response to those needs in an effort to help our customers 
upgrade and build their fleets.” 
 
MDHI’s already flexible options, designed to support a variety of finance scenarios, will expand 
further with this new relationship. Qualified customers will hopefully now have access to more of 
a variety of lease and financing options with more competitive terms.   
 
Qualified commercial and public service customers can access these new options with the 
National Bank of Arizona or one of its many affiliates in the United States. MDHI sales teams are 
committed to helping customers identify the best financing options for their budgets and 
supporting those customers through this journey to hopefully secure the right solution. 
 
To learn more about MDHI’s finance and lease options, contact Jason Lindauer through our 
contact form.  
 
About National Bank of Arizona  
Specializing in forming one-on-one relationships and providing superb customer service, 
National Bank of Arizona offers a broad suite of products and services for individuals and 
businesses—from consumers to executive and private banking clients and from small 
businesses to corporate and commercial clients.  
 
Taking a big picture view of each client’s needs, National Bank of Arizona provides tailored 
financial solutions. Clients are supported with access to executive management and local 
decision-making, all while NB|AZ® bankers contribute valuable financial knowledge and play a 
strategic role in helping clients realize their dreams.  
 
Since its founding in Tucson in 1984, NB|AZ has expanded to play a significant role in 
numerous communities across the state. Backed by the strength of Zions Bancorporation, 
customers get the resources they need with the responsiveness and personalized service they 
expect from a local bank. Loans and certain products are subject to credit approval. For more 
information, please visit NBAZ.com  
 
National Bank of Arizona, A division of Zions Bancorporation, N.A. Member FDIC. 
 

http://www.mdhelicopters.com/
https://www.mdhelicopters.com/contact.html


Disclosures: The statements in this release do not reflect the opinion of the National Bank of 
Arizona or Zions Bancorporation. All financing will be subject to credit approval. Terms and 
conditions apply. 
  
 
 


